
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Terrence agreement going forward 
Date: Mon, 31 Aug 2015 17:37:23 +0000 

Attachments: TCS- STC-LSJE_Letter Agreement2.docx 

attached is his threat for hourly charge at 75 per hour (with 2 hour minimum) without a contract in place.. 
note we did 3 month trial at 2500 per month and now he is proposing 3500 per month which is crazy.. 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Terrence Rabsatt 
Subject: LSJ 
Date: August 30, 2015 at 3:53:33 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < >, Jermaine Ruan < >, 
Jeanne Brennan >, Cecile deJongh < >, Ann 
Rodriquez 

Good day all, 

I just set a new threshold for the link on the gym. I had Anna and everybody on LSJ stream something so I 
could get a good reading. I hope this holds up now until we can replace it. I still have it on manual modulation, 
so I will continue to monitor the link. Times like these is when I lose on a service contract. Please note 
tomorrow is the 31st and my service contract expires then. We don't have a new one in place. If I do have to 
work without it, you will be charged $75.00 per hour with a minimum charge of 2 hrs. 

Regards, 
Terrence Rabsatt 
Ts Computer Services 
The Smarthome Guys 
"We ut the Brains  in your Home" 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA01193324



575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Leighton Allenby < 
Subject: Fwd: 'TCS- STC-LSJE Letter Agreement2' 
Date: August 28, 2015 at 10:02:25 PM EDT 
To: NYC - Richard Kahn 

Leighton Allenby 
Director of Pro erties 

 Forwarded message 
From: Terrence Rabsaft  
Date: Wed, Aug 26, 2015 at 7:30 AM 
Subject: 'TCS- STC-LSJE Letter Agreement2' 
To: Leighton Allenby < >, Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Terrence Rabsatt  I> 

Good morning, 

Here's a copy of the service contract as requested. 

Terrence Rabsatt 
T's Computer Services 
The Smarthome Guys 
"We put the Brains in your Home" 

EFTA01193325


