From: Richard Kahn _
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Svet apt renovation
Date: Thu, 12 Mar 2015 19:50:32 +0000
Attachments: 11P - invoice.pdf

Anthony originally estimated Svet 3M renovation to be 15-18k and 1t appears now that Svet 1s asking for
bathroom to be done which Anthony believes 1s currently in good shape

Should i request pictures or proceed and allow bathroom renovation?

Please advise

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fa
cell

From: Anthony Barrett <|| |G

Subject: 11 P invoice

Date: March 12, 2015 at 11:01:12 AM EDT

Cc: Cecille Matela

To: Richard Kahn >

Hi Rich,

Enclosed 1s the invoice for 11P. It looks like there are two apartments remaining.. 8H and 3M - we will do the
kitchens and 3M will do some bath room work

#H has a large kitchen. None of these will require major elecric or appliances so the prices for each should be
around $15-$18K.

Thanks

Begin forwarded message:

From: Anthony Barrett | -

Subject: 11 P invoice

Date: March 12, 2015 at 11:01:12 AM EDT
Cc: Cecille Matela
To: Richard Kahn

Hi Rich,
Enclosed 1s the invoice for 11P. It looks like there are two apartments remaining.. 8H and 3M - we will do the

kitchens and 3M will do some bath room work
8H has a large kitchen. None of these will require major elecric or applhiances so the prices for each should be
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around $15-F18K.

Thanks

Anthony Barrett
Ossa Properties, Inc.
301 East 66th St
NY NY 10065
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