
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: AC 1085 lease engine agreement 
Date: Fri, 28 Aug 2015 15:29:27 +0000 

Attachments: 16003_Tay_611-8_Engine_Lease_Agreement_2015_150828.pdf; 16004_Tay_611-
8_Engine_Lease_Agreement_2015_150828.pdf; 16004_Tay_611-
8_Engine_Lease_Agreement_2015_Red_Lines.pdf 

Darren will proof one more time but now reads that we pay for usage at end of lease period. 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Goncalves, Kathleen"
Date: August 28, 2015 at 11:18:02 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < >, Lany Visoski <a> 
Subject: RE: AC 1085 lease engine agreement 

Hi Richard and Larry 

Please find attached revised lease agreements. The finally copy is just a mark up to show you what was 
changed. 

Please sign and return today if you wish the engines to ship on Monday. I am still waiting to hear from Larry 
where they should go and what day they need to be there. 

Best Regards, 

Kathleen Goncalves 
Regional Customer Manager 

Rolls-Royce North America, Inc. 
123 Jupiter, FL 33478 
Tel: Cell: 
Fax: 
Email: 

 Original Message 
From: Goncalves, Kathleen 
Sent: Friday, August 28, 2015 10:18 AM 
To: 'Richard Kahn; Larry Visoski 
Subject: AC 1085 lease engine agreement 

Hi Richard and Larry 

I have received agreement that no upfront payment will be required. I am waiting on the revised documents and 
a letter to this effect. We will still need a signed lease agreement in place before we can ship the engines. 
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Larry, please provide shipping address w contact info today and what day you want the engines on site. 

Best Regards, 

Kathleen Goncalves 
Regional Customer Manager 

Rolls-Royce North America, Inc. 
12365 152nd St N, Jupiter, FL 33478 
Tel: ; Cell: 
Fax: 
Email: 

 Original Message 
From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2015 5:51 PM 
To: Goncalves, Kathleen 
Subject: contact info 

nice talking with you 
attached is my contact information 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022
tel
fax 
cell 

This e-mail (including attachments) contains contents owned by Rolls-Royce plc and its subsidiaries, affiliated 
companies or customers and covered by the laws of England and Wales, Brazil, US, or Canada (federal, state or 
provincial). The information contained in this email is intended to be confidential, may be legally privileged 
and subject to export controls which may restrict the access to and transfer of the information. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any retention, dissemination, distribution, interception or 
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited and may subject you to further legal action. Reply to the 
sender if you received this email by accident, and then delete the email and any attachments. 
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