
From: Richard Joslin < 

To: Jeffrey E. <jeevacatioMkgmail.com> 

Subject: FW: RAICH ENDE MALTER & CO. LLP has published American Elect $250K.pdf to the 
BLACK, LEON D. & DEBRA portal 

Date: Mon, 30 Jun 2014 13:41:06 +0000 

Attachments: Notice_of Dissolution _ - _American Elect S250K.pdf 

From: Richard D'Agostino 
Sent: Monday, June 30, 2014 8:01 AM 
To: Abel Goce; Thomas Turrin 
Cc: Richard Joslin 
Subject: FW: RAICH ENDE MALTER & CO. LLP has published American Elect $250K.pdf to the BLACK, LEON D. & DEBRA 
portal 

Did you receive any proof that Demand for Payment was submitted to preserve the claim? 

From: DoNotReply_@cch.com rmailto:DoNotReply_@cch.com) On Behalf Of agoce@rem-co.com 
Sent: Saturday, June 28, 2014 3:46 PM 
To: Richard D'Agostino; Richard Joslin 
Subject: RAICH ENDE MALTER & CO. LLP has published American Elect $250K.pdf to the BLACK, LEON D. & DEBRA portal 

Abel Goce from RAICH ENDE MALTER & CO. LLP has published American Elect $250K.pdf 
to the BLACK, LEON D. & DEBRA portal. Please log into your portal to review the file by 
copying and pasting the following URL into your browser: 
https://portal.cchaxcess.com/portal. The file is located in BLACK, LEON D. & DEBRA\. 

This file is available for download until it expires. The expiration date for this file is set to 
Permanent. 
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