
From: bellaklein  
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Dr 
Date: Wed, 04 Mar 2015 17:37:50 +0000 

Attachments: .pdf 

Jeffrey, 
Attached please find Invisalign treatment invoice in the amount $7525. Please confirm payment. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: March 4. 2015 at 11:18:29 AM EST 
Subject: Re: Dr 
From: B < 
To: bellaklein < 

Hi Bella, 

Yes I comfirmed with JE before I started the treatment. Thanks 

On Tha i  ,March 3, 2015, bellaklein   wrote: 
I Hi

From the attached invoice i understand that you started Invisalign treatment. Please confirm and provide JE 
approval for payment. The total charge is $7525. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

To: 
Subject: Message from KMBT C253 
From: 
Reply-To: 
Date: March 3, 2015 at 12:50.16 PM EST 
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Sincerel • 
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