
From: Lvjet 

To: jeevacation@gmail.com 

Cc: 

Subject: Fwd: S76 charter quote 

Date: Sun, 20 Jul 2014 06:42:32 +0000 

Attachments: 0727FreedomAir quote.pdf 

Jeffrey, 
attached is AAG's quote for Bard Collage Helicopter trip in a Sikorsky S76C++, price $8,349.88 I should be issued a 10% 
discount from our S76 purchases with Sikorsky,. which would lower the quote to $7,549.88 range. 
We have a credit of $12,363.00 that HSI Helicopter Service Inc. owes us in parts from our S76 purchases, Rich Kahn and I 
have been trying to get HSI to issue another check to Hyperion Air LLC or JEGE, LLC, we received a check issued to 
Freedom Air International, in which Rich was unable to deposit since Freedom Air has been dissolved,. 
I am pretty confident we can use the $12,363 money in HSI account to pay for you Helicopter charter,. 

would you like to use this money for the Bard Heli trip? 

thank you, 
Larry 

--Original Message--
From: GP SIK MG Flight Ops 
To: Larry Visoski <Ivjet©aol.com>; DL SIK MG Charter 
Cc: GP SIK MG Flight Ops 
Sent: Sat, Jul 19, 2014 7:47 pm 
Subject: RE: [External] Charter quote 

Good Evening, I've attached a quote for your review based on your submitted request. If you have any 

questions, please feel free to let me know. Anthony McKoy Flight Operations ASSOCIATED AIRCRAFT 

GROUP A Sikorsky Company 32 Griffith Way, Dutchess County Airport 

Fax Toll Free: 

Fax: mail: 

Fractional Ownership, Aircraft Management, Charter Services, Aircraft Maintenance VIP 

Platinum Solutions. Experience the Difference. A message to AAG's valued Charter Customers. "By 

Submitting this charter booking confirmation, Customer agrees to AAG's standard terms and 

conditions, which can be found on AAG's website" A Si 

Sent: Saturday, July 19, 2014 7:26 PM To: DL 

SIK AAG Charter Subject: [External) Charter quote Hello AAG, I need a charter quote for Mr. Jeffrey 

Epstein for July 27th NYC west side pad to Bard collage by Poughkeepsie New York, round trip. Pick 

up 10:30am on July 27th and return 4pm to West Side Pad. Can you pls provide a price? Mr Epstein 

1801bs plus two pax at 1101bs each. Thank you Larry Visoski Freedom Air international, Inc. 

IIII cell -Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA01197536


