From: "Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht" <] -
To: <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: Account Credit
Date: Wed, 07 Jan 2015 18:55:08 +0000
Attachments: 20150107143715533.pdf
Inline-Images: image001.png

For your reference:

Attached is the $50,000 deposit slip and the $450,000 wire transfer -for deposit to

the Financial Strategy Group, LTD. First Bank account number

Jeanne

From: Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht [mailto: || | GGG

Sent: Wednesday, January 07, 2015 11:56 AM

To: Darren Indyke (D ; I C-ilc delongh (N

Cc: 'Erika Kellerhals'
Subject: FW: Account Credit

See the below snapshot of an incoming wire [AQ $450,000.00 to account ending ir'.-
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