
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: WTI trade settlement 3/31/2015 
Date: Thu, 02 Apr 2015 13:44:07 +0000 

Attachments: SHBRK_Scann15040209400.pdf 

attached are original docs along with calculation of unrealized loss of 480,554.99 that must be settled today 
next settlement date is June 30th and quarterly thereafter 
please advise if ok to debit SFL account for 480,554.99 today 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

Begin forwarded message: 

To: 
Subject: Message from KMBT C253 
From: 
Reply-To: 
Date: April 2, 2015 at 9:40:21 AM EDT 
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