
From: bellaklein 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: Gul'sum Osmanova 
Subject: Fwd: 

Date: Mon, 21 Apr 2014 14:28:57 +0000 
Attachments: 3233828_inv.pdf 

Jeffrey, 
The due date for Gulsum tuition balance to the New York Film Academy is 6/13/2014 in the amount of 54,950. It 
can be paid directly to the school. 
Gulsum will need $3900 for the hotel and $1500 for food and supplies expenses. Please advise. 

The housing info for 6 weeks in Paris is below: 

The cost will be $3,900 and does not include food. 

We suggest students bring $250 per week you are stain with us for food etc... 

The invoice for NY Film Academy attached. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Gul'sum Osmanova" < 
Date: April 16, 2014 8:07:38 AM EDT 
To: Bella Klein <I 

Hi, Bella. 

Don't you know the approximate date, when the payment check of NYFA studies and housing could come to 
my hands, so I could attach it to apply for a visa. 
I've done everything else needed besides it since got your money transfer a week ago. 

thank you. 

avec soin, 
Gesum Osmanova. 

EFTA01199239


