
From: Richard Kahn 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Tanya December Invoice 

Date: Tue, 06 Jan 2015 21:53:29 +0000 

Attachments: Epstein_December 2014.pdf 

Attached is Tanya invoice from 11/1/2014 - 12/19/2014 in the amount of 11,820.00 
Darren reviewed and was ok 
Please advise if ok to pay 
Thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Tonja Haddad Coleman < 
To: "Darren Ind ke 

Subject: Invoice 
Date: January 6, 2015 at 9:40:46 AM EST 

Richard Kahn' 

Good morning and happy new year! 
Just a reminder that when there is no money in Trust invoices are due upon receipt. It was not paid upon 
receipt, and had there been money in the account the balance would be due Thursday anyway- please remit 
payment at your convenience. Thank you. 

Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
Tonja Haddad, P.A. 
Advocate Building 
315 SE 7th Street 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 

facsimile 
www.tonjahaddad.com<http://www.tonjahaddad.com>

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke < 
Subject: Re: December Invoice 
Date: December 19. 2014 at 2:17:20 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 
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DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Telecopier 
Mobile:U 
email: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may 
be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, 
and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2014 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On Dec 19, 2014, at 2:16 PM, Richard Kahn < 

PDF please 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel
fa 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

wrote: 

From: Tonja Haddad Coleman 
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Subject: December Invoice 
Date: December 19. 2014 at 2:14:47 PM EST 
To: Darren Ind ke <->, "'Richard Kahn' ( 

Please see attached. Completed today due to the holidays. Thank you and Happy Holidays to you! 

Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
Tonja Haddad, P.A. 
Advocate Building 
315 SE 7th Street 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 

facsimile 

Please add this efiling address to all pleadings:
  mails . 

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is 
intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all 
copies of the original message. 

<winmail.dat> 
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