
From: "Jeanne Brennan Wiebracht"
To: <jeevacation@smail.com> 
Cc: >, "Cecile deJongh" < 

Subject: FW: Estimate from Wire It Enterprises LLC 
Date: Wed, 14 Jan 2015 15:28:11 +0000 

Attachments: Estimate 1024 _ from_ Wire It Enterprises_LLC.pdf 

Please see attached Estimate for TV Samsung 75 4K 2015 . 

From: Wire It Enterprises LLC 
Sent: Tuesday, January 13, 2015 4:10 PM 
To: 
Subject: Estimate from Wire It Enterprises LLC 

Dear Southern Trust Company, 

Please review the estimate below. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions. 
We look forward to working with you. 

Thanks for your business! 
Wire It Enterprises LLC 

  Estimate Summary  
Estimate No. : 1024 
Estimate Date: 01/13/2015 
Total: $6.000.00 
The complete version has been provided as an attachment to this email. 
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