
From: Ann Rodriquez
To: Rich Kahn < >, Daphne Wallace

Cc: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: Invoice from ABC Nursery 

Date: Wed, 22 Jul 2015 22:01:17 +0000 
Attachments: ABC_Nursery_&_Landscaping_$10,910.00.pdf 

Attached is an Invoice from ABC Nursery for the Orlianders that Chris ordered for the Island. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Una Pascal
Date: July 22, 2015 at 3:09:23 PM AST 
To: Ann Rodriquez

FYI 
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