
From: Richard Kahn  

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Tyler invoice 

Date: Thu, 30 Oct 2014 20:06:58 +0000 

Attachments: SHBRK_Scann14103013172.pdf 

attached is Tyler Oct 2014 invoice in the amount of 1,170 
please advise if ok to pay from Enhanced 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Floor 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Date: October 30, 2014 at 1:17:23 PM EDT 
To: 
Reply-To: 

EFTA01202984


