From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: invoice -ion nicola- jan 21, 2015
Date: Wed, 21 Jan 2015 19:00:33 +0000
Attachments: invoice jan2l 2015.doc
Inline-Images: IMG 0940.JPG; IMG 0941.JPG

please advise 1f ok to pay lon for 23 days of work totaling 6,969 + 65.65 (expenses) for total of 7.034.65
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: ion nicola < >

To: Richard Kahn < >
Subject: RE: invoice -ion nicola- jan 21, 2015
Date: January 21, 2015 at 11:26:05 AM EST

hi rich,
we finished everything (gold leafing the hallway) at the house on 71st st vesterday. it looks great!
1 attached here the invoice in amount of $6,969.00 and some receipts in amount of $65.65
s0 the total amount 15 §7,034.65
please let me know if you get this e-mail.

thank you,
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