
From: Richard Kahn < 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: Larry Visoski <1.eiCieelmene 
Subject: Fwd: Velocity Jets Charter Quote 

Date: Tue, 11 Mar 2014 20:28:10 +0000 
Attachments: Quote-2714.pdf 

so far i have received only a hawker 850xp quote for 26,850 total cost 
still waiting on GIV, GV and Challenger 300 quotes 

originally you mentioned march 21st - has date changed now to march 20th? 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

loor, 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: patrick@velocityjets.com 
Subject: Velocity Jets Charter Quote 
Date: March 10, 2014 10:09:08 PM EDT 
To: richardkahn12@gmail.com 
Cc: patrickevelocityjets.com info@velocityjets.com 

Hi Richard, 

Attached please find your quote for your upcoming trip. To secure this aircraft, fax the attached booking 
documents to 954-252-2192. Please feel free to contact me with any questions. 

Thank you, 
Patrick 

PATRICK HARRIS 
VELOCITY JETS 

FORT LAUDERDALE INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT1 1100 LEE WAGENER BLVD, SUITE 113 
FORT LAUDERDALE FL, 333151866-575-53871 CELL 561-901-30991 FAX 954-252-2192 

See this document online at https://airplanemanager.corn/HTML_QuoteInvoice.aspx? 
ID=982060&X=14988cemail=1 
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