From: Richard Kahn *—

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: 124 Parc Monceau Tax Bill
Date: Thu, 30 Jul 2015 16:56:17 +0000
Attachments: 2014 Tax Bill.pdf

attached 15 tax bill we paid

Richard Kahn

fA

Begin forwarded message:

From: Darren Indyke <dkiesq@aol.com=>
Subject: Fwd: 124 Parc Monceau Tax Bill
Date: November 4, 2014 at 12:31:27 PM EST
To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com=

When you have a minute let’s discuss how to deal with finances for this. Thanks.

DARREN K. INDYKE
DARREN K. INDYKE. PLLC

The information comtained in this communication is confidential, may be attorneyv-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indvke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. It you have recerved this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2014 Darren K.
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: 124 Parc Monceau Tax Bill
Date: November 4, 2014 at 12:27:45 PM EST
To: Darren Indyke <dkiesq@acl.com>

yes

On Tue, Mov 4, 2014 at 1:21 PM, Darren Indyke <dkiesqi@acl.com= wrote:
Tax Bill from 124 Parc Monceau. $71,513.28 if paid by November 30, 2014, 372 258.21 if paid by December 31, 2014,
£73,003.14 if paid by January 31, 2015, $73,748.08 if paid by February 28, 2015 and $74 493 if paid after. The actual due date is
March 31, 2015. Please advise whether Rich should pay the Property Tax and if so when? Thanks.

DARREN K. INDYKE
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. |t is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unautherized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2014 Darren K.
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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Begin forwarded message:

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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