From: Richard Kahn m

To: "jeffrey E."
Subject: Fwd: Invoice N9ORIE- WO 3801
Date: Wed, 15 Apr 2015 21:07:04 +0000
Attachments: invoice  15-483, NOORJE.pdf
Inline-Images: image001.png

please advise if ok to pay attached invoice for 27,824
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: Fwd: Invoice - WO 3801

Date: April 10, 2015 at 2:.42:42 PM EDT

To: Rich Kah | >-'= < ~ [

Approved
JEGE Inc

Maintenace items..

Boca aireraft accept amx, but charge 3.5%,. Seamed to much for additional charge.. Check via mail is fine, no

rush

The high dollar item 525,000 was TCAS system AD Mandatory upgrade,.
TCAS is Traffic Collision Avoidance System,. Keeps aircraft From midair collisions ..

Important item,.
Thx,.
Larry

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Amber Barko I GG

Date: April 10, 2015 at 1:32:20 PM EDT

EFTA01203805



Ce: Mike Robinson |

Subject: Invoice N9OSJE- WO 3801

Good afternoon Larry,

Please find attached your invoice for N9OBIE for work order 3801. Let us know if you have any guestions.
Thank you very much,

Ambex _Baxko
Bm:aﬁnin:raﬂ

AT TEMAMNRCE

CRS#3BOR535B/ EASA 145.6261/ BDA/AMO /409
3300 Airport Road Hangar 2, Suite #121 Boca Raton, FL 33431
561-347-3310 Direct/ 561-886-6626 Fax

EFTA01203806



