
From: Richard Kahn < 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Alan Dlugash invoices - April May June 2015 
Date: Wed, 05 Aug 2015 21:10:48 +0000 

Attachments: 20150729143731728.pdf; 20150730172134852.pdf 

attached are the following invoices totaling 14,750 

april 4,275 
may 3,725 
june 6,750 

please advise if ok to pay 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David Hasson 
Subject: Billing 
Date: July 30, 2015 at 5:45:50 PM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn ( 

Hi Rich, 

I am finally caught up with billing through June. 

Let me know if you need anything further. 

Best, 

D. 

David M. Hasson CPA, PFS 
Seckendorf Hasson & Reilly CPA's, LLC 
3000 Marcus Avenue, Suite 3w4 
Lake Success NY 11042 
Phone - 516-488-8400 
Fax - 516-488-8487 
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