From: Richard Kahn %—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Zorro and Microwave Project
Date: Mon, 01 Dec 2014 21:28:46 +0000
Inline-Images: hl-logo.gf

Please confirm we are still waiting for your next visit before we cancel microwave project
FYI1 - FCC license was issued on October 13, 2014 so Advanced year end issues should not be our concern

Microwave Project Cost 48,984
Deposit of 30,000 was sent on 6/25/2014

Please advise
Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Richard L Boltz <} | | -

Subject: Account Status
Date: December 1, 2014 at 3:42:20 PM EST

To: Richard Kahn <
= BMG , Lori Moore
= Ben Lucero < > Pat Mosca

Cc: Darren Indyke

We are nearing the end of the year 2014 and need to close out or continue the 6 GHz microwave link project.
The FCC requires the link to be constructed within the 1 year period from the issuance of the FCC License or
the license is cancelled at no additional cost. If an alternate plan is adopted we should look at updating and
closing the account with Advanced Communications for this project. Please let us know if you have made a
decision on the project.

Regards,

Richard L. Boltz

EFTA01206652



From: Adrienne Gearhar <

Subject: FCC Applications Granted
Date: October 9, 2014 at 1:47:05 PM EDT

Ce: Jeremy Lewis <

FCC Applications Granted
We are pleased to inform you that the following applications have recently been granted by the FCC.

Zorro Development Corp (FRN 0023961220)

Micronet Job: M1418419

" . Grant N
Site Name Call Sign Type Svec Code | Application Number Grant Date
S5andia Crest WQUTAEE Mew MG 0006474444 10/06/2014
Zorro Ranch WauT489 Mew MG 0006474451 10/06/2014

MNote: We send grant notification emails once per week and some applications may still be pending with the
FCC. If you don't see a particular site listed you can check the FCC Application Search page for a complete list of
applications.

Please note that the construction deadline for Microwave Links is 18 months after the grant date.

We thank you for your business and look forward to working with you again soon.

Regards,

7
N

". COMMUNICATIONS, INC

Adrienne Gearhart

720 F Avenue, Suite 100
Plano, TX 75074

EFTA01206653



