
From: Richard Joslin < IMIn 

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Cash 

Date: Thu, 07 May 2015 21:45:09 +0000 

Attachments: Weekly_Cash_Summary_05-07-15.pdf 

cash snapshot. Note APO distrib 5/28/15 slated at 33 cents 

 Original Message 
From: Richard D'Agostino 
Sent: Thursday, May 07, 2015 4:38 PM 
To: Richard Joslin; Samantha Proietto 
Subject: RE: Cash 

Attached. Approx. $14mm of the Leon & Debra total is in DRB only accounts. 

 Original Message 
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Thursday, May 07, 2015 3:54 PM 
To: Richard D'Agostino; Samantha Proietto 
Subject: Cash 

Can you give me cash by entity. JEE asking me. Please let me know if possible by today. Thanks 

EFTA01206828


