
Nikolai Alfsen 

Fra: 
Sendt: 
Til: 
Emne: 

Mr. Alfsen 

First Private Equity Group 
2. mai 2012 13:59 

Re: Please see attached documents as per Mr. William Parker 

I have just checked with the accounts department, and they have advised me that this does not pose any problem at all. 

Go ahead and make the payment from two different accounts, if that is more convenient on your end. 

Regards 

Marlene Olsen 

 Or ainal Messace  
From: 
To: 'Fi si yrivote tuully bruu01 
Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 6:53 PM 
Subject: SV: Please see attached documents as per Mr. William Parker 

Ms. Olsen 
Can I make the transfer for Invoice Number 137219 from two different accounts? 

Med vennlig hilsen 
Nikolai Alison 
Sivilarkitekt 

Fra: First Private Equity Group imailto
Sendt: 2. mai 2012 12:38 
Til: 
Emne: Please see attached documents as per Mr. William Parker 

Mr. Alfsen 

Please see attached documents as per Mr. William Parker. 

Regards 

Marlene Olsen 

 Original Message ---
From: 
To: First Private tritely Group 
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