
From: Bella Klein [-
Sent: 6/18/2018 1:06:23 PM 
To: Rodney Macelus 
CC: Stewart Oldfield 

Subject: Re: Euros from acc mouc9691 

Great 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

; Bradley Gillin [-I;  Richard Kahn 

On Jun 18, 2018, at 12:36 PM, Rodney Macelus <rodnev.macelus@db.com> wrote: 

Bella, 

6,200 EUR @ 1.19 = $7,378 USD Plus $10 shipping fee will total to $7,388 USD. 

Feel free to reach out with any questions. 

Best, 

Rodney Macelus 
Associate 
Deutsche Bank Wealth Management 
345 Park Avenue. 24th Fl 
New York NY 10154 
Tel: 
Fax: 
Email: 

mailto From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Monday, June 18, 2018 11:35 AM 
To: Rodney Macelus 
Cc: Stewart Oldfield < 

Subject: Re: Euros from acc xxxx9691 

>; Bradley Gillin < 

whatever is cheaper, delivery is NY, probably same cost. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

el: 

>; Richard Kahn 
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